
 
 
The Advanced Diploma in Banking and Leadership in a Digital Age (formerly 
known as the Chartered Banker Diploma) – FAQ’S 
 
What is a Chartered Banker? 

The future of banking will look very different from banking today, as banks, banking 
and bankers face many challenges: technological, socio-demographic, regulatory, 
political and reputational.  
  
Our global banking profession needs leaders who understand the forces 
transforming banking and can shape them in a way that benefits customers, 
communities and society as a whole.  Leaders who are highly skilled, professional 
bankers, with expert knowledge of credit, risk, regulation, operations and technology.  
Leaders and professional bankers with a strong sense of social purpose, who are 
proud of the positive role banks can play in supporting economic life and prosperity. 
 
These leaders are the future of banking. They are Chartered Bankers.  
 
What is The Advanced Diploma in Banking and Leadership in a Digital Age? 

The Advanced Diploma in Banking and Leadership in a Digital Age is the flagship 
global banking qualification for individuals at all stages of their career who wish to 
play a significant role shaping the future of banking. Awarded by the Chartered 
Banker Institute, the oldest institute of bankers in the world, The Advanced Diploma 
in Banking and Leadership in a Digital Age combines the universal principles of 
banking (e.g. credit, risk) with up-to-date study of banking in a digital age.   
 
What will I learn? 

You will develop and demonstrate an advanced level of knowledge and skill of the 
principles and practice of banking: credit, risk, regulation, operations and technology; 
plus bank leadership and strategy, all in the context of the major global forces 
shaping the future of banking today. You will study 4 modules: 
 

Bank Leadership, Management & Strategy in a Digital Age 

• Bank Strategy, Operations & Technology  

• Bank Risk Management 
 
Principles & Practice of Banking in a Digital Age 

• Professionalism & Ethics, and either: 

• Personal & Private Banking OR  

• Commercial Lending  
 
 

Can I apply for exemptions? 

The Institute is committed to ensuring that, where appropriate, knowledge and skills 
which are gained via the certificated programmes of other recognised awarding 
bodies can be given credit towards its own professional qualification 
programmes.  For more information on exemptions and how to apply, please see the 
relevant page on our website.   

 

How will I learn? 

You will learn at your own pace, studying when and where it suits you, and can take 
a break from your studies if you need to.  Our online, blending learning programme 

https://www.charteredbanker.com/routes-to-chartered-banker/our-qualifications/recognition-of-prior-learning.html


 
 
will provide you with all the materials you need to develop your expert knowledge of 
banking in a digital age, breaking each module down into smaller units for you to 
work through, and signposting additional resources for you to access when you want. 
 
What support will I get? 

We want you to succeed in your studies and will give you every chance to do so!  
Each module is studied via our online, blended learning system which breaks down 
your learning into manageable units, each with a progress check test to make sure 
you have learned the key concepts from that unit.  Modules are supported by 
recommended reading texts commissioned by the Chartered Banker Institute 
(available in hard copy or electronically), and by tutors who will intervene if they see 
you struggling or if you ask for help. 
 
 
How long will it take? 

You can learn at your own pace, but most students complete The Advanced Diploma 
in Banking and Leadership in a Digital Age in 18-24 months, similar to a part-time 
Masters degree. 
 
How will this help my career development? 

Gaining The Advanced Diploma in Banking and Leadership in a Digital Age will equip 
you with the knowledge and skills you need to play a leading role in banking as it 
continues to undergo significant, disruptive change.  It will give you a banking 
qualification sought after by banks and supported by regulators, marking you out as a 
professional banker and a leader in the future of banking.    
 
Is The Advanced Diploma in Banking and Leadership in a Digital Age for me? 

If you want to play a leading role in the future of banking and develop and 
demonstrate your knowledge of both the core principles of banking, and of banking in 
a digital age, then The Advanced Diploma in Banking and Leadership in a Digital Age 
is for you! 
 
How is Chartered Banker recognized? 

Chartered Banker is recognized and supported by most major UK banks, and helps 
individuals meet the requirements of the PRA and FCA’s Senior Manager and 
Certification Regimes. 

 

Internationally, Chartered Bankers can be found in more than 50 countries, and there 
are international recognition agreements in place in major banking centres including: 
Australia, The Bahamas, Dubai, Hong Kong, India, Ireland, Malaysia and Pakistan. 

 

What happens after I pass The Advanced Diploma in Banking and Leadership in a 
Digital Age? 

You will be invited to become a member of the Chartered Banker Institute, entitled to 
use the “Chartered Banker” professional designation on your business card.  
Becoming a Chartered Banker is a privilege as well as a great opportunity, and to 
remain a Chartered Banker you have to make an annual declaration to comply with 
the Chartered Banker Code of Professional Conduct, and to keep your knowledge 
and skills up to date via CPD. 

 

 



 
 
What next? 

For many bankers, becoming a Chartered Banker is their goal, and leads to many 
career opportunities.  Some Chartered Bankers want to continue their studies and 
can gain an Accelerated MBA from Bangor University via our Chartered Banker MBA 
partnership. 

 

 


